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Request

1. Since 1 April 2023, the number of adults with Prader-Willi Syndrome placed in specialist
residential care services and funded wholly or partly by the organisation.

2. For each such placement, the gross weekly amount most recently paid for the placement,
defined as the total weekly cost charged by the residential service, inclusive of
accommodation (hotel), care and support.

3. Where the gross weekly amount is not held, please provide the weekly amount paid by
the organisation towards the placement.

| do not require provider names, service locations, or staffing details. Individual figures may be fully
anonymised. If necessary, please provide banded ranges (for example £3,000 - £6,000 per person per
week) If any part of this request exceeds the appropriate cost limit, please advise how it may be refined
so that it may be answered.

Response
We do not hold the information that you have requested in an easily retrievable format

Section 12 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 (FolA) relieves a public authority from the
obligation to comply with a request for information where the estimated time required to
locate, review and extract the information exceeds a certain threshold set out in Regulations
(which equates to 18 officer hours). | am satisfied the cost limit applies to your request and
will explain why this is the case.

We do not record this level of detail and when we sampled a number of clients manually
to check for the condition, it took 5 minutes per client with around 1,280 residential
clients to check, amounting to around 107 hours in total.



