



Under the Freedom of Information Act 2000, I would like to request information regarding fly-tipping in Wigan over the past 10 years.

Specifically, I am requesting:

1. The number of fly-tipping incidents reported each year.

Year	Total reports of fly tipping
2016	1816
2017	1391
2018	1410
2019	959
2020	840
2021	1666
2022	2343
2023	2890
2024	3006
2025	2734

2. The number of these incidents involving mattresses, if recorded.

The council does not hold this information – we do not separate items on fly tip reports

3. The cost to the council for collection and disposal of fly-tipped items.

We are unable to differentiate between what is collected as fly tip and what is collected as general litter picking and public litter bins so we're unable to provide a clear and accurate response to this question. The council does not hold this precise information.