
 
 

 

 

 

 

FOI 18670 RESPONSE 

1. How many Labour councillors are drawing a 
pension from Manchester pension fund in 
Tameside 

2. How many Labour councillors are in this 
pension scheme 

1. The Council does not hold this information. 
 

2. Councillors have not been eligible to join the 
local government pension scheme since 2014, so 
the answer is zero to current members paying 
in.  As per question 1, the Council does not hold 
information about Councillors drawing a 
pension from the Greater Manchester Pension 
Fund (GMPF). 
 

GMPF is administered by Tameside Metropolitan 
Borough Council and guidance on making FOI 
requests to Tameside is available at Freedom of 
Information Act 2000 Access Introduction - Tameside 
MBC. 
 
 

 

https://gbr01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fwww.tameside.gov.uk%2Ffreedomofinformation%2Faccess&data=05%7C02%7Cfoirequest%40wigan.gov.uk%7Ccfdbf2257a084193239108ddfd064623%7C8e20fea2f5884539b62cd5cbd4914cb6%7C0%7C0%7C638944925575987041%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJFbXB0eU1hcGkiOnRydWUsIlYiOiIwLjAuMDAwMCIsIlAiOiJXaW4zMiIsIkFOIjoiTWFpbCIsIldUIjoyfQ%3D%3D%7C0%7C%7C%7C&sdata=nZ8BF5cpxVe1lS9ZhZkt%2BOQ2llgqjX7E7v7XMZSBTVM%3D&reserved=0
https://gbr01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fwww.tameside.gov.uk%2Ffreedomofinformation%2Faccess&data=05%7C02%7Cfoirequest%40wigan.gov.uk%7Ccfdbf2257a084193239108ddfd064623%7C8e20fea2f5884539b62cd5cbd4914cb6%7C0%7C0%7C638944925575987041%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJFbXB0eU1hcGkiOnRydWUsIlYiOiIwLjAuMDAwMCIsIlAiOiJXaW4zMiIsIkFOIjoiTWFpbCIsIldUIjoyfQ%3D%3D%7C0%7C%7C%7C&sdata=nZ8BF5cpxVe1lS9ZhZkt%2BOQ2llgqjX7E7v7XMZSBTVM%3D&reserved=0
https://gbr01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fwww.tameside.gov.uk%2Ffreedomofinformation%2Faccess&data=05%7C02%7Cfoirequest%40wigan.gov.uk%7Ccfdbf2257a084193239108ddfd064623%7C8e20fea2f5884539b62cd5cbd4914cb6%7C0%7C0%7C638944925575987041%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJFbXB0eU1hcGkiOnRydWUsIlYiOiIwLjAuMDAwMCIsIlAiOiJXaW4zMiIsIkFOIjoiTWFpbCIsIldUIjoyfQ%3D%3D%7C0%7C%7C%7C&sdata=nZ8BF5cpxVe1lS9ZhZkt%2BOQ2llgqjX7E7v7XMZSBTVM%3D&reserved=0

