Wigan”
Council

In accordance with the terms of the Freedom of Information Act 2000, | write with the below requests for
information. All years specified refer to financial years.

1.

How many major developments (developments
involving 10 or more dwellings) were completed in
your area in a) 2022-23, b) 2023-24 and c) 2024-257?

Of these developments, in how many have the
roads been adopted by the local highways
authority? Please provide the figure for a) 2022-23,
b) 2023-24 and c) 2024-25.

. Of these developments, in how many have the

sewers been adopted by the relevant water and
drainage authority? Please provide the figure for a)
2022-23, b) 2023-24 and c) 2024-25.

. Of these developments, in how many have the

Sustainable Drainage Systems been adopted by
local authority or the local water and sewerage
company? Please provide the figure for a) 2022-23,
b) 2023-24 and c) 2024-25.

Of these developments, in how many have the
public open spaces been adopted by local
authority the Parks Trust or town or parish
Council? Please provide the figure for a) 2022-23,
b) 2023-24 and c) 2024-25.

e 2022-2023 - 2 Development sites completed
o 2023 -2024 -5 Development sites completed
o 2024 —2025-12 Development Sites completed

e 2022-2023 -7 roads fully adopted

e 2023-2024 16 roads fully adopted

e 2024-202517 roads fully adopted. 5 roads part
adopted. New Wigan Bus Station also adopted.

We do not hold this information. This would be held
by the Developer

We do not hold this information. This would be held
by the Developer

e 2022-2023-0
e 2023-2024-0
e 2024-2025-0



