
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 

I am requesting the following information regarding the adoption status of Ash Grove, Standish, 
Wigan. WN6 0DZ: 
 
1. A copy of the official adoption plan showing 

the exact extent of the adopted highway, 
including footpaths, verges, or adjacent land. 

 

The information you have requested is 
exempt from disclosure under Section 
21(1)(b) of the Freedom of Information Act 
2000. This section applies where the 
information is reasonably accessible to the 
applicant by other means.  Information is to 
be taken to be reasonably accessible to the 
applicant if it is information which the public 
authority or any other person is obliged by or 
under any enactment to communicate 
(otherwise than by making the information 
available for inspection) to members of the 
public on request, whether free of charge or 
on payment.   In this case, the information 
you are seeking is already available through 
Private streets at a cost of £12. 
 

2. The date the road (or sections of it) was 
adopted. 

 
3. The legal mechanism used for the adoption 

(e.g., Section 38 Agreement or Section 228 of 
the Highways Act 1980). 

 
4. A copy of any Section 38 agreement(s) or 

adoption certificates related to the road. 
 
5. Details of any correspondence, notices, or 

public records concerning the adoption 
process for this road. 

 
6. Any plans or maps used by the council to 

determine the boundary between public 
highway and private land in this area. 

The road was partially adopted on the 1st of 
June 1973. 

 
Unfortunately, we do not hold this 
information due to the age. 

 
 

Unfortunately, we do not hold this 
information due to the age. 
 
Not available due to the age of adoption.  
 
 
 
Please see response at Q1 

 


