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Request Response
1. Total number of backdated CTR requests refused. Not recorded
2. Of those refusals, how many were recorded by the Not recorded

Council as having:

a. Adisability (as defined under the Equality Act
2010)?

b. A psychiatric illness, mental health condition, or
neurodivergent condition (including but not limited
to autism, ADHD, schizophrenia, bipolar disorder, or
PTSD)?

c. No declared disability?

3. If the Council does not routinely record disability This request falls outside the scope of the
information as part of CTR, please confirm this and Freedom of Information Act, as it does not
explain:- relate to recorded information held by the

authority but is instead a general question.
How the Council ensures compliance with its duties

under the Public Sector Equality Duty (Equality Act
2010, section 149), particularly in relation to disabled,
neurodivergent, and mentally ill applicants.



