
 
 
 
 
 
 

Request 

1. How many deprivation of liberty orders for under 
18s were applied for by the authority from 2020-
2025? Please could this be broken down by year - 
with 2025 please provide figures from the start of 
the year to now? 

 
 
 
 
 
2. How many deprivation of liberty orders for under 

18s were granted to the authority from 2020-2025. 
Please could this be broken down by year - with 
2025 please provide figures from the start of the 
year to now? 

 
 
3. What was the longest deprivation of liberty order 

granted to the authority for an under 18 between 
2020-2025? 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
4. What was the shortest deprivation of liberty order 

granted to the authority for an under 18 between 
2020-2025? 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
5. What was the average length of deprivation of 

liberty orders granted to the authority for an 
under 18 between 2020-2025? 
 

Response 

2020 – We do not hold this data. 
2021 – This data is not held in a reportable format.  
To retrieve this data would require a deep dive of 40 
records\files and would take in excess of 18 hours, 
therefore Section 12 of the FOI Act 2000 is engaged. 
2022 - as above 
2023 - as above 
2024 - as above 
2025 - as above 
 
2020 – We do not hold this data 
2021 - 11 
2022 - 14 
2023 - 15 
2024 – 15 
2025 - 2 
 
2020 – We do not hold this data 
2021 - This data is not held in a reportable format.  
To retrieve this data would require a deep dive of 40 
records\files and would take in excess of 18 hours, 
therefore Section 12 of the FOI Act 2000 is engaged. 
2022 - as above 
2023 - as above 
2024 – 12 months 
2025 – 12 months 
 
2020 – We do not hold this data. 
2021 - This data is not held in a reportable format.  
To retrieve this data would require a deep dive of 40 
records\files and would take in excess of 18 hours, 
therefore Section 12 of the FOI Act 2000 is engaged. 
2022 - as above 
2023 - as above 
2024 – 1 month 
2025 – 2 months 
 
2020 – We do not hold this data 
2021 – This data is not held in a reportable format.  
To retrieve this data would require a deep dive of 40 
records\files and would take in excess of 18 hours, 
therefore Section 12 of the FOI Act 2000 is engaged. 
2022 – as above 
2023 – as above 
2024 – 8 months 
2025 – 7 months 

 


