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Through Freedom of Information, | am interested to know the following:

Environmental health inspections

1.

2.

The number of inspections carried out on asylum accommodation by environmental health
officers in each of a) 2023 b) 2024 and c) the first quarter of 2025

A breakdown, by category, of the hazards recorded from these inspections in each of these
time periods (for example pests, mould, fire safety risks etc)

A breakdown, by category, of any notices issued to the accommodation provider or the Home
Office in each of these time periods (for eg improvement plans, remedial instructions, full
enforcement action)

If held in a reportable format, the number of asylum accommodation properties that have
had multiple inspections by environmental health officers in each of these time periods

Please note, the below information relates to asylum accommodation for which we have
inspected following a complaint.

1.

2023 - Not recorded

2024 (recorded since April) =1
2025-0

This information is not recorded
0

2023-0

2024 -0

2025-0

HMO licence inspections

5.

6.

The number of HMO licence inspections carried out on asylum accommodation by the local
authority in each of a) 2023 b) 2024 and c) the first quarter of 2025

A breakdown, by category, of the hazards recorded from these inspections in each of these
time periods (for fire safety risks, gas safety, room sizes, sufficient amenities etc)

A breakdown, by category, of any notices issued to the accommodation provider or the Home
Office in each of these time periods (for eg improvement plans, remedial instructions, full
enforcement action)

If held in a reportable format, the number of asylum accommodation properties that have
had multiple HMO inspections in each of these time periods

2023 - Not recorded

2024 (recorded since April) -

2025-0

Not recorded.

2023-0

2024 (recorded since April) — 1 formal enforcement notice
2025-0

2023-0

2024 (recorded since April) - 13

2025-0



