
 

 
 
 
 
 

 
I am submitting a freedom of information request about potholes in your authority area, 
specifically:  
 

1. The number of potholes reported in the 
last 3 years. Please provide the figure for 
each year (2022, 2023, 2024.) 

2022- 1182 
2023-2237 
2024- 4229 

2. The combined width of the potholes in 
meters for each year, again (2022, 2023, 
2024.) 

We do not hold this information, as we 
do not record width of potholes. 
 

3. The average time in calendar days it takes 
to repair the potholes for each year (2022, 
2023, 2024.) 

 

2022 – 8.90 Days 
2023 – 8.80 Days 
2024 – 8.85 Days 
 

4. How much is spent on repairing potholes 
each year? Again, (2022, 2023, 2024.) 

 

2022- £627,480 
2023- £820,598 
2024- £648,794 
 

5. Total number of potholes reported to your 
authority, since you began recording this 
data. 

 

Digital records began in 2017 
2017-886 
2018-1385 
2019-1477 
2020-1212 
2021-1331 
2022-1182 
2023-2237 
2024-4229 
 

6. How much money has been given to 
drivers as compensation due to poor road 
conditions in the past (2022, 2023, 2024.) 

 

2022 - £11,340.66 
2023 - £2013.00 
2024- £22,922.98 

 


