
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 

As a freedom of information request, please provide for 2018, 2019, 2020, 2021, 2022, 2023, 2024 
and so far in 2025: 

1. The number of Multi-agency Safeguarding Hub 
(MASH) referrals made. 

 
a) If it would be possible within the time limit of 

this request, please provide this figure split by 
reason. 

b) If a would not be possible to provide this 
within the time limit of this request, please 
only provide the number of referrals citing 
violent behaviour by the child who is the 
subject of the referral. 

c) If neither a nor b would not be possible within 
the time limit, please instead provide them 
not split by reason. 

 
2. The number of referrals made to Non-Violent 

Resistance (NVR) courses. If it would be possible 
within the time limit of this request, please 
provide this figure split by reason. 

See attached - due to the changes to the 

system we can only reliably report on 
this in the full year from 2024 and YTD 
2025. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
We do not hold or record this data. 

 
 

 
  



 
 
 

Management Reason for Contact 2024 2025 

16-17 Homeless 32 5 

Advice and Support 1414 208 

Alcohol Misuse - Adult 202 36 

Alcohol Misuse - Child 38 8 

Anti-Social Behaviour - Adult 45 7 

Anti-Social Behaviour - Child 41 13 

Asylum Seeking Welfare Concerns 8 0 

Behavioural Difficulties 628 182 

Bullying - Perpetrator 5 5 

Bullying - Victim 40 10 

Child Abuse Linked to Spiritual or Religious Beliefs 5 5 

Child Criminal Exploitation 91 30 

Child Death Notification 23 0 

Child in Need Transfer In 22 0 

Child Missing Education / School Attendance 63 9 

Child Protection Plan Transfer In 8 0 

Child Sexual Exploitation 128 26 

Crime - Adult 423 122 

Crime - Child 118 59 

Domestic Abuse - Adult 2817 854 

Domestic Abuse - Child 109 46 

Emotional Harm 728 60 

Extremism, Radicalisation and Terrorism (Prevent Concerns) 10 7 

Female Genital Mutilation 14 0 

Financial Support 5 5 

Homeless / Risk of 125 34 

Housing Issues 65 21 

Identity Related Concerns 5 5 

Inappropriate Sexualised Behaviour 78 15 

Information Request 3426 789 

Learning Difficulty - Adult 5 5 

Learning Difficulty - Child 7 5 

Mental Health - Adult 607 172 

Mental Health - Child 442 137 

Missing From Home 171 27 



Neglect 1199 182 

Neighbour Nuisance - Victim 7 0 

No Recourse to Public Funds (NRPF) 5 5 

Non-Mobile Baby Protocol (NAI) 39 14 

Parent / Carer Deceased 5 0 

Parenting Support 1017 315 

Peer on Peer Abuse 5 0 

Physical Health / Disability - Child 152 20 

Physical Health / Disabilty - Adult 23 11 

Physical Violence and / or Abuse 1131 216 

Poor Home Conditions 40 26 

Risk to Children 286 227 

Self Harm - Adult 0 5 

Self Harm - Child 23 10 

Sexual Harm 764 196 

Social Isolation - Child 7 0 

Social Media / Internet Misuse / Issues 89 42 

Special Guardianship Order (SGO) 10 5 

Substance Misuse - Adult 407 137 

Substance Misuse - Child 92 45 

TDS Pathway Request 93 39 

Teenage Pregnancy 5 0 

Unaccompanied Asylum-Seeking Children 6 0 

Unborn Pre-Birth 56 37 

Not Recorded 13 7 
 


