
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 

I am writing to you requesting information under the Freedom of Information Act 2000. Could 
you please provide me with the following information:  

1. The number of incidents recorded in your area 
due to a collapse on a school estate in:  

 
a. 2020 
a. 2021 
a. 2022 
a. 2023 
a. 2024 

 
2. The number of incidents recorded in your area 

due to a fire on a school estate in:  
 

a. 2020 
a. 2021 
a. 2022 
a. 2023 
a. 2024 

 
3. The number of incidents recorded in your area 

due to partial or total collapse on a school 
estate in:  
 
a. 2020 
a. 2021 
a. 2022 
a. 2023 
a. 2024 

 

I am assuming this refers to structural 
collapse. This is information we do not hold, 
however as far as we are aware within the 
community schools that the LA is responsible 
for, there has been no such collapse in any of 
the years requested. 
 
 
 
This is information we do not hold, however 
as far as we are aware within the community 
schools that the LA is responsible for, there 
has been no recorded incidents of fire in any 
of the years requested. 
 
 
 
 
I am assuming this refers to structural 
collapse. This is information we do not hold, 
however as far as we are aware within the 
community schools that the LA is responsible 
for, there has been no such collapse partial or 
total in any of the years requested. 

 

 


