
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 

Under the Freedom of Information Act 2000, please can you provide me with the following 
information on veterans and social housing in your local authority: 

1. The number of veterans that were on a social 
housing waiting list in your local authority, in 
each month since the start of the financial year 
2018/19; 

Information is not available month by month 
as we only take a snapshot of the housing 
register at each quarter. The historical 
number of veterans is not recorded anywhere 
within our quarterly reporting so we are not 
able to retrieve this data. 
 
Current number of applicants on the housing 
register with a registration date since 1st April 
2018 that have indicated they have an armed 
forces connection - 254  

2. The average length of time spent by a veteran on 
a social housing waiting list in your local 
authority, since the start of the financial year 
2018/19;  

Information is not available month by month 
as we only take a snapshot of the housing 
register at each quarter. The historical 
number of veterans is not recorded anywhere 
within our quarterly reporting so we are not 
able to retrieve this data. 
 
Average time on the housing register – 691 
days. This is not necessarily a true indication of 
wait time as some applicants are not actively 
bidding. 
 

3. The longest time a veteran has spent on a social 
housing waiting list in your local authority since 
the start of the financial year 2018/19; 

Information is not available month by month 
as we only take a snapshot of the housing 
register at each quarter. The historical 
number of veterans is not recorded anywhere 
within our quarterly reporting so we are not 
able to retrieve this data. 
 
Longest application - 23rd July 2018. 
 

4. The number of complaints made by veterans in 
social housing about their social housing 
provision to your local authority, in each month 
since the start of the financial year 2018/19; 

Information not held 

5. The number of veterans that contacted your local 
authority asking for financial support of any kind 
in each month since the start of the financial year 
2018/19.  

 

Information not held 

 


