
 
 
 

 
 
 
 

REQUEST 17228 RESPONSE 

I am writing to submit a Freedom of Information 
request for data on the location of all street lights 
maintained by the council.  Specifically, I would like to 
obtain: 
 
1. The most recent available data on street lighting 

locations. Please provide the total number of 
streetlights maintained by the council and the 
actual location of these lights (the latter in 
Shapefile, KML, and/or GeoJSON format). 

 
 
2. Data on street lighting locations from 2014.  Please 

provide the total number of streetlights maintained 
by the council and the actual location of these 
lights (the latter in Shapefile, KML, and/or GeoJSON 
format). 

 
3. Data on street lighting locations from 2010. Please 

provide the total number of streetlights maintained 
by the council and the actual location of these 
lights (the latter in Shapefile, KML, and/or GeoJSON 
format). 

 

 
 
 
 
 
1. Please see the link to our live asset 

data for street lighting. You will be 
able to download the data in your 
preferred format from this.  
Streetlighting | Wigan Council Open 
Data 

 
2. We do not hold this data as we work 

on live data. 
 
 
 
 

3. We do not hold this data as we work 
on live data. 

 

https://wigancouncil-wigan.opendata.arcgis.com/datasets/d0c314ba0bdf4396bba39baa0229a15e/explore?layer=0&location=53.585059%2C-2.646604%2C18.55
https://wigancouncil-wigan.opendata.arcgis.com/datasets/d0c314ba0bdf4396bba39baa0229a15e/explore?layer=0&location=53.585059%2C-2.646604%2C18.55

