

## Request

I am writing to make a request under the Freedom of Information Act 2000.

Please provide the following information in two tables, one for primary and one for secondary. I would like the following information for the 2019-20 autumn term, 2021-22 autumn term and 2022-23 autumn term:

- 1. The number of children temporary excluded at least once, broken by primary and secondary school.
- 2. The number of these children with special educational needs (SEN)
- 3. The number of these children with an Education, Health and Care Plan (EHCP)

## **Response**

The official DfE data for Autumn Term 19-20 and 21-22 is available for public access at:

<u>Create your own tables, Table Tool – Explore education statistics – GOV.UK (explore-education-statistics.service.gov.uk)</u>

Autumn Term 22-23 - Local data

	Mainstream primary school pupils			Mainstream secondary school pupils		
Year	Temporary Exclusions	SEN Temporary Exclusions	SEN with EHCP	Temporary Exclusions	SEN Temporary Exclusions	SEN with EHCP
22-23 (Autumn)	88	Data not held	32	587	Data not held	45