wigan

I'd like to issue a Freedom of Information request for the following information:

1. The total number of potholes reported in your
area in 2023

2. The total number of potholes filled in your area in
2023

3. The total number of potholes reported in your
area between 2017-2022

4. The total number of potholes filled in your area
between 2017-2022

5. The total number of potholes reported in your

area between 2011-2016

6. The total number of potholes filled in your area
between 2011-2016

7. The average depth of the potholes filled in your
area in 2023, 2017-2022 and 2011-2016

1024

3418 (Please note the information supplied is all
carriageway minor repairs completed as this is the data
we hold)

8386

27,577 (Please note the information supplied is all
carriageway minor repairs completed as this is the data
we hold)

We do not hold this data

We do not hold this data

We do not hold this data. However, between 2011 and
2018 our intervention level to action a carriageway repair
was 40mm. From October 2018 till now, this remains at
40mm but is now classed as an investigatory level as per
our risk based approach outlined in our highways safety
inspection policy. This can be viewed online at Highways-
maintenance-safety-inspection.pdf (wigan.gov.uk).



https://www.wigan.gov.uk/Docs/PDF/Resident/Parking-Roads-Travel/Highways-maintenance-safety-inspection.pdf
https://www.wigan.gov.uk/Docs/PDF/Resident/Parking-Roads-Travel/Highways-maintenance-safety-inspection.pdf

