
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 

Under the freedom of information act could you please provide info on the following 
 
 
1) Monies received for the housing of illegal migrants/ 

refugee’s/asylum seekers @ Kilhey Court hotel. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

2) Monies ANTICIPATED to be received for the housing 
of illegal migrants/refugee’s/asylum seekers @ Kilhey 
Court. 
 

3) All public consultation documents regarding the 
housing of illegal migrants/refugee’s/asylum seekers 
@ Kilhey Court. 

 
 
4) All council department meeting notes regarding the 

above  

1. The Council has received no money for the 
housing of asylum seekers at Kilhey Court Hotel.  
Please find the below link to the Home Office 
website which details the funding received for 
every Local Authority: 

 
Accommodation sites factsheet - April 2023 - 
Home Office in the media (blog.gov.uk) 

 
Please note the paragraph from that link.   

 
For existing dispersed accommodation and beds 
in hotels, the government will provide local 
authorities with a one off £750 payment for each 
asylum seeker who is in Home Office 
accommodation on the 1st April 2023 – up from 
£250 last year.  The payment will be made during 
quarter 1 of 2023/24. 

 
The payment is for each asylum seeker who is in 
Home Office accommodation on the 1st April 
2023; Kilhey Court was not Home Office 
accommodation on that date. 

 
2. The Council does not hold this information as 

future funding has not been announced by the 
Government. 
 

3. The Council does not hold this information as it 
was the Home Office’s decision to use Kilhey 
Court; any consultation would be the 
responsibility of the Home Office. 

 
4. As there have been no consultations, there are no 

meeting notes. 

 

https://homeofficemedia.blog.gov.uk/2023/04/03/accommodation-sites-factsheet-april-2023/
https://homeofficemedia.blog.gov.uk/2023/04/03/accommodation-sites-factsheet-april-2023/

