
 

 
 
 
 

 
 

Request 
 
Request under the FOI Act.  BME Volunteers CIC would like to request that a copy of the following 
information [or public sector duty/equality assessments documents containing the following information] be 
provided: 
 
1) A list (public names, telephone numbers and emails) of black-led organisations, groups, networks, 

forums, or entities that applied for funding from 1 Jan 2019 to 1 Jan 2023    
 
2) A list (public names, telephone numbers and emails) of black-led organisations, groups, networks, 

forums, or entities that secured funding from 1 Jan 2019 to 1 Jan 2023  
 
3) Your recommendations for recognition and promotion for Black-Led organisations at you location with 

good values   
 
 
Response 
 
Q1 and Q2 
 
When groups apply for funding we do not ask for demographic information and therefore we do not hold 
specific data to respond to this question.  
 
All of the groups that have been funded through Community Recovery, Community Safety and Community 
Investment Fund can be found on our web pages. This will include the name of the group and the amount 
of funding received.  I have included the links below.  
 
Community Recovery Fund (wigan.gov.uk) 
 
Deal for Communities Investment Fund (wigan.gov.uk) 
 
Community safety fund (wigan.gov.uk) 
 
Brighter Borough fund (wigan.gov.uk) 
 
Q3 
 
Information not held 
 

 

https://www.wigan.gov.uk/Council/The-Deal/Deal-Communities/Funding/Community-Recovery-Fund.aspx
https://www.wigan.gov.uk/Council/The-Deal/Deal-Communities/Funding/Deal-for-Communities-Investment-Fund.aspx
https://www.wigan.gov.uk/Council/The-Deal/Deal-Communities/Funding/Community-safety-fund.aspx
https://www.wigan.gov.uk/Business/Finance-and-Grants/Community-funding/Brighter-Borough-Fund.aspx

