Wigan

I am requesting the following information under the Freedom of Information Act:

Domiciliary care:

1) The number of council-funded adult domiciliary care
packages/clients returned to the council by a provider (e.g.
due to lack of capacity/funding) in January 2023

2) The number of council-funded adult domiciliary care
packages/clients returned to the council by a provider each
month since January 2022 (including February 2023, if

1. None

2. Not available

available) 3. None
3) The number of unallocated/unsourced adult domiciliary care

hours in February 2022 4. None
4) The current number of unallocated/unsourced adult

domiciliary care hours 5. N/A
5) The number of clients the question 4 figure relates to.
Residential care:
6) The number of council-funded adult residential care 6. None

packages/clients returned to the council by a provider (e.g.
due to lack of capacity/funding) in January 2023

7) The number of council-funded adult residential care
packages/clients returned to the council by a provider each
month since January 2022 (including February 2023, if
available)

8) The number of council-funded care users currently awaiting
an adult residential care placement

9) The average length of time the care users referred to in
question 8 have been waiting for.

7. Jan - July 2022: None

Aug 2022: 13 residential placements
handed back to the Local Authority
from one provider. This was due to a
business decision made by the provider
to change their specialisms and
services under their CQC registration.
Sep 22 - Feb 23: None

8 & 9. This information is not recorded
on the IT system.

If the information for any question cannot be sourced within the section 12 cost limit, please mark that question as
‘information not held’ and respond to the remainder of the request. If necessary for section 12 purposes, please
exclude questions 1-5 entirely and process questions 6-9 of this request.

I would like the information sent by email in the attached Excel spreadsheet.




