
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

I would like to request the following information in accordance with the Freedom of Information Act, relating 
to working from home policies.  

a) How many employees in your organisation work from 
home (work from home being more than 5 hours per 
day) more than once a week? 

We have 9 designated home workers.   
We do not hold this data as this is managed 
across services in line with needs of the service. 

b) The number of employees in your organisation and, of 
these, the number able to perform their work remotely 
(i.e., not those who are front-line workers) and the 
number who have started returning to in person work.  

We do not hold this data.  We do however 
operate a blended approach to working whether 
this be from a designated council building, 
within the community or home in line with 
needs of the service. 

c) What percentage of time, per week, are employees in 
your organisation entitled to work from home? 

There is no specified time and this would 
managed across services in line with service 
needs. 

 


