
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 

The Isle of Wight Council’s Adult Social Care & Housing Needs Directorate is looking at how it is performing against 
other Local Authorities in the country surrounding Overdue Reviews. As part of a project initiation, please can you 
provide the following performance figures as of 30.11.2022:  

1) How many Reviews do you have for the following categories: 
 

a. 6 Week Reviews 
b. 6 Month Reviews 
 
c. 12 month Reviews 
d. Over 1 Year 
e. 2 Years 

 
 

a) 4 
b) Information not held – we only Schedule 6 week (First Review of 

Support Plan) and 12 month (Ongoing Review of Support Plan) 
c) 3357 
d) See (b) 
e) See (b) 

2) How many of these Reviews are ‘Overdue’ in the following categories: 
 

a. 6 Week Reviews 
b. 6 Month Reviews 
 
c. 12 month Reviews 
d. Over 1 Year 
e. 2 Years 

a) 4 
b) Information not held – we only Schedule 6 week (First Review of 

Support Plan) and 12 month (Ongoing Review of Support Plan) 
c) 1524 
d) See (b) 
e) See (b) 

3) Furthermore, do you have a publicly accessible policy on 
managing reviews which could be provided within your 
response to this FOI.  

No 

 


