Wigan

REQUEST

5G MASTS

RESPONSE

Please supply the following information under this request as governed by the Freedom of Information Act:

1)

The ICNIRP certificates issued for 5G masts in the Council s
area.

2)

The power output of each antenna in dbm or Watts for each
5G mast in the Council" s area and the power intensity drop
off calculations supplied by the applicants for any 5G beams
emitted from such antennae, since 5G beams do not obey
the inverse square law.

The Council is not the body that regulates
telecoms masts from the point of view of
radio emissions, and so does not hold this
information. The regulating body is OFCOM
https://www.ofcom.org.uk/

3)

A copy of the section of the Council s public liability
insurance policy showing indemnity cover for any potential
personal injury claims which might be brought to the Council
in relation to harm caused by wireless pulsed microwave
radiation from this 5G technology; it is alleged that a USA
telecom company is making provision for such claims in its
statutory accounts and wireless technology has the same
technical signature worldwide. For example, a 5G technical
parameter is beam-forming.

Please see attached document

4)

The Environmental Impact Assessments conducted by the
Council for 5G masts.

Masts are rarely if ever classed as
“Environmental Impact Development” and so
the Council does not hold this information.
Any details submitted in support of a planning
application for a specific mast is already in the
public domain, obtainable via the Council’s
webpage
https://www.wigan.gov.uk/Resident/Planning-
and-Building-Control/Planning/Search-
planning-applications.aspx




MdVE l I The Leadenhall Building

Public Sector 122 Leadenhall Street

London
EC3V 4AN
t 0207 086 3366

To Whom It May Concern

Dear Sirs,
Re: Wigan Council

This is to confirm that Wigan Council have Insurance cover in force with effect from 15 May 2022 until
the policy expiry on 30" April 2023 on the basis as detailed below.

Policy Number: P22CASLFG00038

Insured: Wigan Council
Wigan Metropolitan Development Company

Limit of Indemnity: Public and Products Liability ~ £50,000,000
Employers’ Liability £50,000,000
Self-Insured Retention: £250,000 any one occurrence

For full details of the policy coverage please refer to the policy schedule and wordings.

Yours Faithfully
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