
 
 
 
 
 

 
 

I am writing on Friday 18 November to make an open request for information to which I am entitled under the 
Freedom of Information Act 2000.  My questions are as follows:  

1. Please inform me how many fixed speed cameras your 
authority is responsible for. If possible, please break this 
down by device type (EG Gatso, Truvelo, HADECS). 

None. 

2. Please inform me how many average speed cameras your 
authority is responsible for. If possible, please break this 
down by device type (EG SPECS, VECTOR, Siemens). 

None. 

3. Please inform me of the total financial cost to your authority 
of maintaining and calibrating the fixed speed cameras your 
authority is responsible for from 2018 to present. Please 
break this down by calendar or financial year.  If possible, 
please also break this down by device type. 

Nil. 

4. Please inform me of the total financial cost to your authority 
of maintaining and calibrating the average speed cameras 
your authority is responsible for from 2018 to present. Please 
break this down by calendar or financial year. If possible, 
please also break this down by device type. 

Nil. 

5. If possible, please inform me how many speeding tickets were 
issued by the fixed cameras your authority is responsible for 
from 2018 to present. Please break this down by calendar or 
financial year, and by device type if possible. 

This information is not held by Wigan Council.  
 
Speed cameras are managed and maintained 
by the TfGM Greater Manchester Road Safety 
Partnership on behalf of the 10 GM local 
authorities 

6. If possible, please inform me how many speeding tickets were 
issued by average cameras your authority is responsible for 
from 2018 to present. Please break this down by calendar or 
financial year, and by device type if possible. 

 

This information is not held by Wigan Council.   
 
Speed cameras are managed and maintained 
by the TfGM Greater Manchester Road Safety 
Partnership on behalf of the 10 GM local 
authorities 

 


